












Chapter 16.04
INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE*

Sections:
16.04.010 Adoption of the Intemational Building Code.

16.04.012 Section 101.4.3 and Section 101.4.6 amended - Plumbing - Energy.

16.04.015 Definitions.
16.04.016 Repealed.
16.04.020 Section 101.3=amended - Intent.
16.04.030 Section 104.1 amended- General.
16.04.035 Section 113 amended - Board of Appeals.
16.04.040 Section 114 amended - Violations
16.04.050 Repealed.
16.04.060 Section 105.2 amended - Work exempt from permit.
16.04.065 Repealed.
16.04.070 Section 105.3 and Section 105.3.1 amended - Application for permit.

16.04.071 Section 105.3.1 amended - Actions on Applications.
16.04.072 Section 105.5 amended - Expiration.
16.04.075 Repealed.
16.04.080 Repeoled.
16.04.090 Repealed.
16.04.095 Section 3410 amended - Security deposit required to move or remove building.
16.04.100 Section 109.2 amended - Schedule of permit fees.

16.04.105 Repealed.
16.04.108 Repealed.
16.04.110 Repealed.
16.04.140 Repealed.
16.04.145 Table 503 amended - Allowable Building Heights and Areas.

16.04.150 Section 1805 amended - Darnp proofing and Waterproofing.
16.04.160 Section 3307 amended - Protection of adjoining property.

16.04.170 Repealed.
16.04.200 Repeoled.
16.04.210 Section 705.5 amended - Fire-resistance ratings.

16.04.215 Section 705.8 amended - Openings.
16.04.220 Section 903.2 amended - Where required.

16.04.230 Section 1008.1.9.3 amended - Locks and latches.

16.04.240 Section 1008.1.9.4 amended - Bolt Locks.

16.04.250 Repealed.
16.04.900 Severability.

*For building code adoption by reference, see RCW 35.21.180.

16.04.010 Adoption of the International Building Code.

Exhibit A
Ord. 3006

















16.04.180 Section 5506 UBC added - Membrane structures.
Repealed by Ord. 2216.

16.04.190 Section 3305(e) UBC amended - Access to exits.
Repealed by Ord. 2216.

16.04.200 Restriction of building permits - Over one acre.
Repealed by Ord. 2216.

16.04.210 Section 705.5 - Fire-resistance ratings.
Section 705.5 adopted by this chapter is deleted and replaced with the following wording:

705.5 Fire-resistance ratings. Exterior walls shall be fire-resistance rated in
accordance with rables 601 and 602 of the IBC or Lynnwood Municipal code Title 9
whichever is more restrictive.

16.04.215 Section 705.8 amended - Openings.
Section 705.8 adopted by this chapter is deleted and replaced with the following wording:

705.8 openings. All openings in exterior walls shall comply with rable 705.g IBC or
Lynnwood Municipal Code Title 9 whichever is more restrictive.

16.04.220 Section 903.2 amended - Where required.
Section 903.2 adopted by this chapter is deleted and replaced with the following wording:

903.2 Where required. Approved automatic sprinkler systems shall be installed as
required by Sections 903.2.1 through 903.2.12 and Lynnwood Municipal code Title 9
whichever is more restrictive.

16.04.230 Section 1008.1.9.3 - Locks and latches.
Section 1008. 1.9.3 adopted by this chapter is amended by deleting option number 2.

16.04.240 Section 1008.1.9.4 - Bolt Locks.
Section 1008.1.9.4 adopted by this chapter is amended by deleting exceptions number 3 and 4.

16.04.250 Restricting issuance of permits.
Repealed by Ord. 2683. See amended IBC Section l05.3.1.j.

16.04.900 Severability.
If any section, sentence, clause or phrase of this chapter be held to be invalid or
unconstitutional by a court of competent jurisdiction, such invalidity or unconstitutionality
thereof shall not affect the validity or constitutionality of any other section, subsection,
sentence, clause, phrase or word of this chapter.

Exhibit A
Ord 3006

9



Chapter 16.05
INTERNATIONAL ENERGY

CONSERVATION CODE

Sections:
16.05.010 Adoption of the Intemational Energy Conservation Code.
16.05.015 Section Rl09 and Section C109 amended - Board ofAppeals.
16.05.020 Section Rl 10 and Section Cl10 amended - Violations.
16.05.900 Severability.

f6.05.010 Adoption of the International Enerry Conservation Code.
As amended by this chapter and the State of Washington Building Code Council, under
Chapter 51-1lR and Chapter 51-1lC WAC, the 2012 Edition of the lnternational Energy
Conservation Code (IECC), as published by the Intemational Code Council, one copy of
which, along with the State of Washington Building Code Council's amendments, shall be
on file with the Lynnwood finance director, are adopted by this reference.

16.05.015 Section R109 and Section C109 amended - Board of Appeals.
Section R109 and Section C109 adopted by this chapter are deleted and replaced with the
following wording:

109,1 Application for appeal. The hearing examiner shall hear and decide
appeals of orders, decisions or determinations made by the building official
relative to the application and interpretation of this code in accordance with
Chapter 16.50 LMC.

109.2 Limitations of authority. An application for appeal shall be based
on a claim that the true intent of this code or the rules legally adopted
hereunder have been incorrectly interpreted, the provisions of this code do
not fully apply or an equally good or better form of construction is
proposed. The hearing examiner shall have no authority to waive
requirements of this code.

16.05.020 Section R110 and Section Cl10 amended - Violations.
Section Rl10 and Section cl10 adopted by this chapter are deleted and replaced with the
following wording:

110 Violations. Any person, firm, or corporation violating any of the
provisions of this Code shall be guilty of a misdemeanor, and each such
person, firm or corporation shall be guilty of a separate offense for each
and every day, or portion thereof, during which any violation ofany ofthe
provisions of this Code is committed, continued, or permitted.

Anyone concemed in the violation or failure to comply with the provisions
of this Code, whether indirectly committirg the act or efficting the

Exhibit B
Ord.3006



omission constituting the offense, or aiding or abetting the same, whether
present or absent; and anyone who directly or indirectly counsels,

encourages, hires, commands, induces or otherwise procures another to
violate or fail to comply with the provisions of this Code, is and shall be
guilty of a misdemeanor.

Conviction of any such misdemeanor shall be punishable by a fine of not
more than $1,000 or by imprisonment for not more than 90 days, or by
both such fine and imprisonment.

16.05.900 Severability.
If any section, subsection, paragraph, sentence, clause, phrase or word of this chapter should

be held to be invalid or unconstitutional by a court of competent jurisdiction, such invalidity
or unconstitutionality thereof shall not affect the validity or constitutionality of any other

section, subsection, paragraph, sentence, clause, phrase or word ofthis chapter.

Exhibit B
ord. 3006

2



Chapter 16.09
INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE

Sections:
16.09.010 Adoption ofthe Intemational Residential Code.
16.09.020 Section R101.3 amended - Intent.
16.09.025 Section R102.7.2 of Chapter 5l-51 WAC amended - Moved buildings.
16.09.030 Section RI04.1 amended - General.
16.09.040 Section R105.2 amended - Work exempt from permit.
16.09.042 Section R105.3.1 amended - Action on application.
16.09.045 Section R105.5 amended - Expiration.
16.09.050 Section Rl08.2 amended - Schedule of permit fees.
16.09.060 Repealed.
16.09.065 Section Rl 10.3 amended - Certificate issued.
16.09.070 Section R112 amended - Board of Appeals.
16.09.080 Section R1 13 amended - Violations.
16.09.090 Section R202 amended - Definitions.
16.09.100 Table R301.2(1) amended - Climate and geographical design criteria.
16.09.900 Severability.

16.09.010 Adoption of the International Residential Code.
As amended by this chapter and the State of Washington Building Code Council under
Chapter 51-51 WAC, the 2012 Intemational Residential Code (IRC), published by the
Intemational Code Council except Chapters l1 and 25 through 43, one copy of which, along
with the State of Washington Building Code Council Amendments, shall be on file in the
office of the Lynnwood finance director, is adopted by reference.

16.09.020 Section Rl01.3 - Intent.
Section Rl01 .3 adopted by this chapter is deleted and replaced with the following wording:

R101.3 Intent. It is expressly the purpose ofthis Code to provide for and promote the
health, safety and welfare of the general public and not to create or otherwise
establish or designate any particular class or group of persons who will or should be
especially protected or benefited by the terms ofthis Code.

It is the specific intent of this Code that no provision or term used in this Code is
intended to impose any duty whatsoever upon the City or any of its officers or
employees for whom the implementation or enforcement of this Code shall be
discretionary and not maadatory. Nothing contained in this Code is intended to be nor
shall be construed to create or form the basis ofany liability on the part ofthe City, or
its officers, employees or agents for any injury or damage resulting from the failure
of a building to comply with the provisions of this Code, or by reason or in
consequence of any inspection, notice, order, certificate, permission, or approval
authorized or issued or done in connection with the part of the City related in any
mamer to the enforcement of this Code by its otficers, employees or agents.

Exhibit C
Ord.3006



16.09.025 Section R102.7.2 of Chapter 51-51 WAC amended - Moved buildings.
Section R102.7.2 of the IRC as adopted by the state of Washington in Chapter 51-51 WAC is
amended by deletion of Exceptions number I and2.

16.09.030 Section R104.1 amended - General.
Section Rl04.l adopted by this chapter is deleted and replaced with the following wording:

R104.1 General. The building official is hereby authorized to enforce all the
provisions of this Code. For the purpose of administering and enforcing Appendix J

of the International Building Code, the director of public works is appointed and
designated as the building official with respect to all matters contained within
Appendix J.

The building official shall have the power to render interpretations of this Code and
to adopt and enforce rules and regulations supplemental to this Code as he or she may
deem necessary in order to clarifu the application of the provisions of this Code. Such
interpretations, rules and regulations shall be in conformity with the intent and
purpose of this Code.

16.09.040 Section R105.2 amended - Work exempt from permit.
Section R105.2 adopted by this chapter is amended by revising the building exempt from
permit numbers I and2 to read as follows:

Building:

1. One story detached accessory structures, provided the floor area does not exceed 120
square feet.

2. Fences not over six feet high as follows:

a. Vision obscuring fences as defined in Chapter 2t.10 LMC in residential zones that
are set back over 15 feet from front property line, over 15 feet from driveways, and
30 feet from any intersection;

b. Non-vision obscuring fences as defined in Chapter 21.10 LMC in residential zones.

16.09.042 Section R105.3.1 amended - Action on application.
Section R105.3.1 adopted by this chapter is amended by adding the following paragraphs:

The following prerequisites shall be met prior to issuance of a building permit.

l. Any requirements or regulations imposed on a project as a condition of land use
approval process.

2. If required, all fire apparatus roads shall be approved.

Exhibit C
Ord. 3006

2







Chapter 16.24
INTERNATIONAL SWIMMING POOL

AND SPA CODE

Sections:
16.24.010 Adoption of the International Swimming Pool and Spa Code.
16.24.015 Definitions.
16.24.020 Repealed.
16.24.025 Repealed.
16.24.030 Abandoned swimming pools.
16.24.040 Repealed.
16.24.050 Setbacks.
16.24.052 Section 105.5.3 and Section 105.5.4 amended - Expiration - Extensions.
16.24.055 Permit fees.
16.24.060 Repealed.
16.24.070 Section 107.4 amended - Violation penalties.
16.24.080 Section 108 amended - Means of appeal.
16.24900 Severability.

16.24.010 Adoption of the International Swimming Pool and Spa Code.
As amended by the provisions of this chapter and the State of Washington Building Code
Council, the 2012Intemational Swimming Pool and Spa Code (ISPSC), one copy of which,
along with the State of Washington Building Code Council's amendments, shall be on file in
the office of the Lynnwood city clerk, is adopted by this reference.

16.24.015 Definitions.
Section 201 adopted by this chapter is amended by adding thereto the following paragraph:

Whenever the term "Code" is used herein, it shall mean the 2012 Intemational
Swimming Pool and Spa Code as adopted by this Chapter. Whenever the term oocity"

or "Jurisdiction" is used herein, it shall mean the City of Lynnwood.

16.24,020 Amendments and additions.
Repealed by Ord. 1504.

16.24.025 Chapter 5 of Uniform Code deleted - Fuel gas piping.
Repealed.

16.24.030 Abandoned swimming pools.
Swimming pool installations which have been determined to be abandoned shall be filled
with sand or other granular materials as may be approved by the administrative authority.

16.24.040 Safety devices.
Repealed.

Exhibit D
Ord. 3006



16.24.050 Setbacks.
A11 swimming pools, portable or pennanent, shall be placed so as to observe the minimum
setbacks for structures.

16.24.052 Section 105.5.3 and Section 105.5.4 amended - Expiration.
Permits become null and void if the authorized work has not been inspected by this

department within 180 calendar days of issuance or for a period of 180 calendar days from
the last inspection. The total life of permits is limited to a maximum of 540 calendar days,

provided it has not expired under the restrictions above. One extension request for 180

calendar days may be granted if a written request is submitted to the Building Official
showing just cause before the expiration date.

If a permit expires, the permittee shall obtain a new permit to complete the remainder of the

work. The cost of the new permit will be based on the value of the remainder of work per

the fee schedule.

16.24.055 Permit fees.
Section 105.6 adopted bylhis chapter is deleted and replaced with the following wording:

105.6 Fees. Fees shall be set forth in a resolution adopted and from time to time
amended by the city council.

16.24.060 Building official - Enforcement of chapter.
Repealedby Ord. 1504.

16.24.070 Section 107.4 amended - Violation penalties.
Section 107 .4 adopted by this chapter is deleted and replaced with the following wording:

Any person, firm or corporation violating any provision of this Code shall be deemed
guilty of a misdemeanor, and each such person, firm, or corporation shall be guilty of
a separate offense for each and every day, or portion thereol during which any
violation of any of the provisions of this Code is committed, continued or permitted.

Anyone concerned in the violation or failure to comply with the provisions of this
Code, whether directly committing the act or efflecting the omission constituting the
offense, or aiding or abetting the same, whether present or absent; and anyone who
directly or indirectly counsels, encourages, hires, commands, induces or otherwise
procures another to violate or fail to comply with the provisions of this Code, is and

shall be guilty of a misdemeanor.

Upon conviction of any such misdemeanor, such person, firm, or corporation shall be

punishable by a fine of not more than $1,000 or by imprisonment for not more than

90 days, or by both such fine and imprisonment.

16.24.080 Section 108 amended - Means of appeal.
Section 108 adopted by this chapter is deleted and replaced with the following wording:

Exhibit D
Ord.3006



108.1 Application for appeal. The hearing examiner shall hear and decide appeals of
orders, decisions or determinations made by the building official relative to the
application and interpretation of this code in accordance with Chapter 16.50 LMC.

108.2 Limitations on Authority. An application for appeal shall be based on a claim
that the true intent of this code or the rules legally adopted thereunder have been
incorrectly interpreted, the provisions of this code do not fully apply or an equally
good or better form of construction is proposed. The hearing examiner shall have no
authority to waive requirements of this code.

16.2 4.9 00 Severability.
If any section, sentence, clause or phrase of this chapter is held to be invalid or
unconstitutional by a court of competent jurisdiction, such invalidity or unconstitutionality
shall not affect the validity or constitutionality of any other section, subsection, sentence,
clause, phrase or word of this chapter.

Exhibir D
Ord. 3006

J







Chapter 15.08
INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE

Sections:
15.08.010 Adoption of the Intemational Mechanical Code.
15.08.015 Definitions.
15.08.020 Section 108.4 amended - Violation penalties.
15.08.025 Section 106.4.3 amended - Expiration.
15.08.030 Section 106.5.2 amended - Fee schedule.
15.08.040 Repealed.
15.08.050 Section 109 amended - Means of Appeal.
15.08.060 Section 606.2.2 amended - Common supply and retum air systems.
15.08.900 Severability.

15.08.010 Adoption of the International Mechanical Code.
As amended by this chapter and the State of Washington Building Code Council, the
2012 Edition of the Intemational Mechanical Code (IMC), as published by the
Intemational Code Council, one copy of which, along with the State of Washington
Building Code Council's amendments, shall be on file with the Lynnwood finance
director, are adopted by this reference.

15.08.015 Definitions,
A. Section 201 adopted by this chapter is amended by adding thereto the following
paragraph:

Whenever the term "Code" is used herein, it shall mean the =2012 International
Mechanical Code as adopted by this chapter. Whenever the term ,,City,, or
'Jurisdiction" is used herein, it shall mean the City of Lynnwood.

B. Section 202 adopted by this chapter is amended by adding thereto the following
definition:

SAME COMMON ATMOSPHERE. An occupied area of a building where
multiple supply, retum, or plenum air distribution systems are allowed to mix.

15.08.020 Section 108.4 amended - Violation penalties.
Section 108.4 adopted by this chapter is deleted and replaced with the following wording:

108.4 Violation penalties. Any person, firm or corporation violating any of the
provisions of this code shall be guilty of a misdemeanor, and each such person,
firm or corporation shall be guilty ofa separate offense for each and every day, or
portion thereof, during which any violation of any of the provisions of this Code
is committed, continued or permitted.

Exhibit F

Ord. 3006





109.1.1 Limitations of authority. An application for appeal shall be based on a
claim that the true intent of this code or the rules legally adopted hereunder have
been incorrectly interpreted, the provisions of this code do not fully apply or an
equally good or better form of construction is proposed. The hearing examiner
shall have no authority to waive requirements of this code.

15.08.060 Section 606.2.2 amended - Common supply and return air systems.
Section 606.2.2 adopted by this chapter is amended by deleting the first paragraph and
replacing it with the following wording:

606,2.2 Common supply and return air systems. Where multiple air-handling
systems share the same common atmosphere or cornmon supply or return air
ducts or plenums with a combined design capacity greater than 2,000 cfm, the
return air systems of each unit shall be provided with smoke detectors in
accordance with section 606.2.1.

15.08.900 Severability.
If any section, sentence, clause or phrase of this chapter is held to be invalid or
unconstitutional by a court of competent jurisdiction, such invalidity or
unconstitutionality shall not affect the validity or constitutionality of any other section,
subsection, sentence, clause, phrase or word of this chapter.

Exhibit F
Ord.3006


























