
ITB # 2767 - Meadowdale Park Improvements Bid Tabulation Results
Apparent Lowest bids are Emerald Paving Inc. and KA General Construction Contractor LLC

Parking Lands PN Shelter Total
Contractor Name Phase 1 Phase 2 Phase 3 Total

* Forest Gardens LLC 120,562.73$ 59,549.33$ No Bid
* Total Landscape Corporation / Brian Adams No Bid 51,217.18$ No Bid
* Emerald Paving Inc 65,825.10$   No Bid No Bid
* KA General Construction Contractor LLC 70,973.74$   43,917.92$ 38,416.92$ 153,308.58$ 
* Wyser Construction Co Inc 76,745.70$   74,905.56$ 54,845.10$ 206,496.36$ 
* JBD Excavation 87,730.20$   No Bid No Bid
* PNW Construction & Design LLC 104,040.94$ No Bid 46,665.00$ 
* W.S. Contractors LLC 132,309.00$ 70,272.00$ 45,018.00$ 247,599.00$ 
* Dungeness Construction Corporation 119,846.70$ No Bid No Bid
* Buntting Inc No Bid No Bid 79,093.94$ 
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